11/19/2020 5:44 PM

Re: 1930 — SPORT COUPE (50-B)
To John Williams <j.albert001@hotmail.com> @ SCaMmer

John,
Thank you for your prompt reply to my emails.

I must respectfully request that you send me a cashiers check for only the purchase price of the vehicle ($18,500). |
do not want to be responsible for any funds in excess of the purchase price. The ads that | placed in MAFCA and
MARC clearly stated that the buyer would be responsible for the shipping costs. Those costs are solely between
you and the shipper, please do not involve me.

If you send me a check for more than $18,500, it will be returned to you.
Thank you for your understanding,

On November 19, 2020 at 4:59 PM John Williams <j.albert001@hotmail.com> wrote:

Will txt u again wit a tracking nbr for the pkg sent once | have it.Will need u to do me one little favor.As soon as
the check arrive and clears u deduct ur $18,500 and I'll direct you how to send extra funds to be included to
shipper to enable them arrive ur place for pickup that's all.

As soon as the check clears,you will deduct your $18,500 agreed price and I'll email you instructions how to
send the excess funds included on the check to the shipper to enable them come for pickup.

Do pls email me your cell phone number so | can text for quicker response and confirm you will await the
payment to arrive soon.

John.



